YR WP, 3T & f[AUTT/ Govt. Of India, Dept. of Space
ﬂ-ﬂ?'cﬂ'qwﬁ\EWﬁ/ Indian Institute of Remote Sensing
YR 3feRRE& FHUM TS/ Indian Space Research Organisation

4 PG AR, U1, 9. . 135, § gRIg-248001 /

4, Kalidas Road, PB No. 135, Dehradun248001
November 18, 2025
12 ST ¥ 16 STa, 2026 TF JRATAT T T6  fAAW g Urgdshar (3iiwersa) R
fagmor & fow wand'vava, & fov gafaq sefigart & g”

List of Selected Candidates for One-week (offline) special Short Course on ‘Al/ML for
Agriculture Analytics’ during Jan 12- Jan 16, 2026.

sFACaRt & forw Agcaygol AR/ Important Instructions to the Candidates

1.td goe fadu ureEmsd (3iihersd) N fAswer & fow wmguaTa/’ S 12 el &
16 STAaY, 2026 & SR IS frar Smwen, & gafaa secart & g Iw uea
s Rl

List of Selected Candidates for one-week (offline) special course ‘Al/ML for Agriculture
Analytics’ to be held during Jan 12- Jan 16, 2026., is provided herewith.

2.7 Tufag Ieficarl @ 25 ddER, 2025 (23:59 Foi( dF 1IRS TsfA/VYS UEel )URL:
https://admissions.iirs.gov.in/) & HICIH & UISThA Yob  .F)13,000/-) Pl HITATH 3T
HIAT BT, dTfeh UTSTshdA # FiFaAfod el 1 sahr Feafad gAafka @ arl FuifRa
HidHA A Tob Yoob o1 PITT o el W IS & Y a1 Swom 3R Hie 3Tl
gaTT FAT waitlist) B SFAGAR P UGl P FATTIT|

All Selected Candidates MUST pay the course fee (Rs. 13,000/-) through the IIRS
admission portal (URL.: https://admissions.iirs.gov.in/), latest by Nov 25, 2025 (23:59 HRS)
to indicate their willingness to join the course. If the fee is not paid by the given last date,
the selection will be cancelled and it will be offered to the next waitlist candidate.

3.¥e & gy gwy F R o ueR & /Yed W F v dfaw [ARA /
fFaR & 30y w fher o o a0 Rer 7@ Rear s

No request for extension of the last date/time in confirmation of seat / payment of fee
shall be entertained under any circumstances.

4, 3FHCarRT B TATE & Sl & fF e & -, gk gadht gaATansit 3nfe & T &
foT o &1 I FHT @ Ugd X ¢ fhdl o wcwfa aRfEUfa & sror
foefad ¢ & fow-3rmwa da/3mS3mS3Rey fohdll 8 UhR & 3TRerRY & aem|

Candidates are advised to make the fee payment well in advance to avoid any transactional
delay, server related issues, etc. IIRS does not hold any responsibility for the delayed / failed
transactions due to any unforeseen circumstances.

5. I PIs SFAIGAR UTSThA H A &l ¥ Ugel AT AMFAS B & I1G a9d oidT &, ar
Yotk P AT IMSIHSHRTH & “Yoeh aradl Afd” & HFAR & S0, AT da@se W
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IUSEY & )https://www.iirs.gov.in/iirs/sites/default/files/pdf/Fee_Refund_Policy.pdf) |

In case any candidate withdraws from the course before or after joining, refund of fee will
be made according to Fee Refund Policy of I1IRS, available in the website
(https://www.iirs.gov.in/iirs/sites/default/files/pdf/Fee Refund_Policy.pdf).

. EYONT  3MTS3MS3IRUT dGdTSE  )https://www.iirs.gov.in/) T UehIfd i sreaft| sesfieart
B HTS UGl S 3EE 3R IEINEHRTE dadrse & afdd &9 @ Siad e
AT ik TARIS HIRIART FHT W Hl S Foh| 3FAGaR HI 3R F et off g &
TRUTATART MSIMSIRTI DS THFAGRT el ofdm|

Announcements shall be made on IIRS website (https://www.iirs.gov.in/). Candidates must
regularly check their registered email ID and I1IRS website for updates and necessary action

at their end. 1IRS does not hold any responsibility, resulting from any lacuna on part of the
candidate.

. STEIATSIRTY el off UTSTRAIREA & We R/ I 7 RS &1 o RSR R
@ B

[IRS reserves the right to fill or not to fill seat(s) in any of the courses/disciplines.
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List of Selected Candidates for the special course ‘Al/ML for Agriculture Analytics’
during Jan 12 — Jan 16, 2026.

Sr.No. | Registration Number Name Selection Status
1. 11RS202513715562042 Ruchir Patidar SELECTED
2. 11RS202513715567709 Majid Farooq SELECTED
3. 1RS202513715569973 NAVEEN MUNISAMY SELECTED
4. 11RS202513715569936 Sagar Dattatraya Vibhute SELECTED
5. [1RS202513715575216 Dr M Rajasekhar SELECTED
6. 11RS202513715559056 Vijaya Kautikrao Ahire SELECTED
7. 11RS202513715563579 Abdul Samad SELECTED
8. I1RS202513715562813 Manjunath M N SELECTED
9. 1RS202513715575615 Gaurav Shukla SELECTED
10.  |IIRS202513715559421 Sukant Jain SELECTED
11. |IIRS202513715566774 Lokhande Ganesh Bapu SELECTED
12.  ]IIRS202513715575671 Piyush Das SELECTED
13.  |IIRS202513715559095 Vivek Chandra Poddar SELECTED
14.  [IIRS202513715569112 Mukesh Kumar badtya SELECTED
15.  |IIRS202513715576840 Soumyajit Mazumdar SELECTED
16. |IIRS202513715569365 Lokesh Kumar Upreti SELECTED
17.  |IIRS202513715563181 Ishan Bipin Ajmera SELECTED
18. |IIRS202513715577056 Nikhil Bhati SELECTED
19. |IIRS202513715561859 Chaudhari Dhara Mahendrabhai SELECTED
20. |IIRS202513715569794 VVarsha Vithal Bhosale SELECTED
21. |IIRS202513715576073 Revanth Bezawada SELECTED
22.  |IIRS202513715565376 Tejaswini R C SELECTED
23.  |IIRS202513715562313 Sudip Sarkar SELECTED
24.  |IIRS202513715576539 D Narasimha chetan SELECTED
25.  |IIRS202513715559408 Suraj Vishwajit Shah SELECTED
26. |IIRS202513715575054 Vishwajeet Ravikiran Marathe WAITLISTED-1
27. |IIRS202513715559132 MUHAMMED BILAL CA WAITLISTED-2
28.  |IIRS202513715562062 Gopal Prasad Patel WAITLISTED-3
29. |IIRS202513715562063 Anoop Dongre WAITLISTED-4
30. [IIRS202513715563042 Hayam Boboy Singh WAITLISTED-5
31. [IIRS202513715571197 GADDAM SIDHARTHA WAITLISTED-6
32.  [IIRS202513715562582 KADAMBARI TIWARI WAITLISTED-7
33.  [lIRS202513715576218 Narvaneni Akshara WAITLISTED-8
34.  [IIRS202513715563641 Abhishek Dhir WAITLISTED-9
35.  [lIRS202513715572453 Nagesh Mishra WAITLISTED-10
36. [IIRS202513715572227 Pooja Nishad WAITLISTED-11
37.  |IIRS202513715564237 Apratim Bhattacharya WAITLISTED-12
38.  [IIRS202513715565664 fardeen khan WAITLISTED-13
39.  [lIRS202513715576420 Samir jaiswal WAITLISTED-14
40. |IIRS202513715565153 Keerti Bharatesh Kamble WAITLISTED-15
41. |IIRS202513715576661 Samrath Prakash WAITLISTED-16
42. |IIRS202513715568101 Sakshi Mishra WAITLISTED-17
43. |IIRS202513715561017 Pooja Gangadhar Wadi WAITLISTED-18
44. |IIRS202513715565647 Arya M WAITLISTED-19




45.  IIRS202513715565745 Shubham Kumar Jha WAITLISTED-20
46. |IIRS202513715562224 Baratam Rakesh WAITLISTED-21
47. IIRS202513715573709 Shreya Singh WAITLISTED-22
48. |IIRS202513715557852 Lakshmikant Tiwari WAITLISTED-23
49. |IIRS202513715570296 Amritpal Digra WAITLISTED-24
50. [IIRS202513715569552 Swapnendu Das WAITLISTED-25
ol. |IIRS202513715563733 MAHENDRA SINGH JHARIYAWAITLISTED-26
52. [IIRS202513715568658 VANDANA KATNA WAITLISTED-27
53. VIRENDRA ABHESING WAITLISTED-28
[1RS202513715575171 PATEL
54.  [IIRS202513715577066 Kavita Ravindra Shelke WAITLISTED-29
95.  [IIRS202513715566832 Sparsha suresh WAITLISTED-30
56. |IIRS202513715559113 Prasanna G Kelageri WAITLISTED-31
57. |IIRS202513715564312 SINSHA P S WAITLISTED-32
58. |IIRS202513715567791 Suvam Nanda WAITLISTED-33
59. [lIRS202513715563315 Fazin Firoz WAITLISTED-34
60. |IIRS202513715566834 SREENIDHI SAJI WAITLISTED-35
61. |IIRS202513715576647 Sriyansu Nayak WAITLISTED-36
62. |IIRS202513715563312 PRANAV ANAND WAITLISTED-37
63. |IIRS202513715575207 SHRUTI DHORAJIYA WAITLISTED-38
64. |IIRS202513715571136 Lavanya Maidam WAITLISTED-39
65. |IIRS202513715563345 Ayush Srivastava WAITLISTED-40
66. |IIRS202513715566849 Abin B Babu WAITLISTED-41
67. |IIRS202513715563305 Drishty Singh WAITLISTED-42
68. |IIRS202513715576674 Shaifali Thakur WAITLISTED-43
69. |IIRS202513715571167 AYANA K K WAITLISTED-44
70.  IIRS202513715563582 Ayesha Ruhi WAITLISTED-45
/1. IIRS202513715562492 Nikhil Patel WAITLISTED-46
72.  |IIRS202513715576880 Saiyada Suphiya Khatoon WAITLISTED-47
73.  |IIRS202513715576140 Mahima WAITLISTED-48
74. Illinda Naga Venkata Laxmi Sai WAITLISTED-49
[1RS202513715563588 Kiranmai
/5. |IIRS202513715567815 Rohit Kumar Sharma WAITLISTED-50
76.  |IIRS202513715562783 Kamal Singh Kanyal WAITLISTED-51
77. |IIRS202513715563367 SHUBHRA PANDEY WAITLISTED-52
78.  IIRS202513715559399 RISHABH SINGH WAITLISTED-53
79.  |IIRS202513715569379 DEEPTI DIXIT WAITLISTED-54
80. |IIRS202513715571009 VIVEK KUMAR WAITLISTED-55
81. [IIRS202513715561509 JEFFIN PAPPACHAN WAITLISTED-56
82. |IIRS202513715573943 Jeyashree N WAITLISTED-57
83. |IIRS202513715576158 Akash VL WAITLISTED-58
84. |IIRS202513715576180 JINSE P GEORGE WAITLISTED-59
85. |IIRS202513715558896 Dheeraj Lubana WAITLISTED-60
86. [IIRS202513715572880 MANJEET SINGH WAITLISTED-61
87. [IIRS202513715561438 Nishant Sharma WAITLISTED-62
88. [IIRS202513715569139 Ayush kumar verma WAITLISTED-63
89. |IIRS202513715560200 Basavaraj Somappa Nittur WAITLISTED-64
90. |IIRS202513715562300 Gunjan khantwal WAITLISTED-65
91. |IIRS202513715559302 Shaikha Zuha Fatima WAITLISTED-66




92. |IIRS202513715563656 ANAND CHAURASIA WAITLISTED-67

93. |IIRS202513715571721 Purushottam Prasad Shukla WAITLISTED-68

94. |IIRS202513715565527 Pankaj Kumar WAITLISTED-69

95. |IIRS202513715571460 Karchella Chaitanya WAITLISTED-70

96. |IIRS202513715563568 Neha Ishwar Tatar WAITLISTED-71

97. |IIRS202513715576145 shweta WAITLISTED-72

98. |IIRS202513715565809 Bhagyashree Sharad Amrutkar  WAITLISTED-73

99. |IIRS202513715560666 Shweta Govinda Shinde WAITLISTED-74
100. [IIRS202513715566713 Sabiya Rubbani WAITLISTED-75
101.  |lIRS202513715575649 Rahul Visagh H WAITLISTED-76
102.  |IIRS202513715574863 Mansi Pal WAITLISTED-77
103.  |IIRS202513715567040 Karnapu Usha Rani WAITLISTED-78
104.  |IIRS202513715576204 Savita WAITLISTED-79
105.  [IIRS202513715566270 Divaker Garkoti WAITLISTED-80
106.  [IIRS202513715576503 Nitin Lohumi WAITLISTED-81
107.  lIRS202513715569261 Shivam Raj WAITLISTED-82
108. [IIRS202513715562232 Ashvni Mishra WAITLISTED-83
109. |IIRS202513715573441 Sivapuram Sandhya WAITLISTED-84
110. |IIRS202513715574856 VVarun Kohli WAITLISTED-85
111.  |IIRS202513715561806 Rutuja Surendra Damkondwar ~ WAITLISTED-86
112.  IIRS202513715575792 Tulu Pradhan WAITLISTED-87
113.  [IIRS202513715560055 Akanksha WAITLISTED-88
114, 1IRS202513715568009 Kukkala Geethika DEvi WAITLISTED-89
115.  |IIRS202513715571030 VIKASH KUMAR WAITLISTED-90
116. [IIRS202513715562105 TRISHLA VERMA WAITLISTED-91
117.  |IIRS202513715570112 Saurabh Yadav WAITLISTED-92
118. [IIRS202513715564718 ANJANEY OJHA WAITLISTED-93
119. |IIRS202513715569216 Chenchu Pavan Kalyan WAITLISTED-94
120.  [IIRS202513715564962 SHEEBA QURESHI WAITLISTED-95
121, [IIRS202513715565794 Asmit Kumar Singh WAITLISTED-96
122.  [IIRS202513715565947 siddhartha pasumarthy WAITLISTED-97
123.  |IIRS202513715564838 ASHISH KUMAR SHARMA  WAITLISTED-98

*khkkhkkhkkhkkhkkhkkikkikikk

Page 2 of 2




